
 
 

 

 

EXECUTIVE BOARD AGENDA 
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Thursday, March 21, 2024 
3:00pm – 6:00pm 

LATTC, Culinary Arts Building, 2nd Floor, Room 201 / Zoom

  
I. Call to Order (5 minutes) 

II. Flag Salute (2 minutes) 

III. Meeting Protocols (5 minutes) 

IV. Approval of Agenda (2 minutes) 

V. Approval of Minutes from February 12, 2024 meeting (3 minutes) 

VI. Action Items (30 minutes) 

a. Legal Bill 

b. Profit/Loss Statement 

c. AFT Convention 2024 (July 21-25, 2024) Delegates 

d. Academic Senate Proposed Bill 

e. Classified Day of Action (May 21, 2024) Attendees 

f. Women for a New Los Angeles – LAANE (May 10, 2024) Attendees   

g. Lobby Day (April 24, 2024) Attendees  

VII. Chapter Reports (20 minutes) 

☐ City ☒ District Office ☐East  ☐Harbor ☐ Mission 

☐ Pierce ☐ Southwest  ☐Trade-Tech ☒Valley ☐ West ☐Retirees 

VIII. Executive Director/Monitor Report (60 minutes) 

a. District Consultation 

b. PC Consultation 

c. BOT 

d. JLMBC 

e. Additional Comments 

i. Negotiations 

ii. OIT Update 

IX. Officer Reports (10 minutes) 

a. President 

b. 1st Vice President 

c. 2nd Vice President 

d. Treasurer 

e. Recording Secretary 

f. Grievance Secretary 
  



X. Committee Reports (10 minutes) 

a. COPE: Julio Ortiz, Political Coordinator 

b. EEO: Cassaundra Walker 

c. Elections: Mark Bergquist 

XI. Conference/Convention/Training Reports (10 minutes) 

a. CSPCA Conference 

b. March on March 

c. CFT March Summit 

XII. Affiliate Reports (5 minutes) 

a. LA County Federation Labor Delegate – Dionne Morrissette 

b. Activities Coordinator – Chad Baugher 

XIII. New Business (5 minutes) 

XIV. Adjournment 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

Next Executive Board Meeting: April 11, 2024, LAVC 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 
OPEIU: 537, AFL-CIO/SM 



 

 
E-Board Meeting Minutes 

 

 

Date: February 12, 2024 
Time: 5:30pm 

In Attendance via Zoom  
 
Executive Director/Monitor: Luukia Smith 

Advisors: Chad Baugher, Yovanna Campos, Maira Cruz, Andrea Edwards, Jesse Saucedo 

City: Jasminee Haywood-Daley, Aldie Paz, Mitch Polin, Edith Villavicencio 

District: Hazel Alonzo, Kimberly Davillier, LaShawn Duffin, Yung Kim, Gloria Moreno 

East: Alejandro de la Parra, Jennifer Estrada, Josue Ramirez, Rowena Smith-Kersaint, Lynn Wood  

Harbor: Anthony Alvarez, Andy LaBrune, Nadine Muro, Justin Raines, Ken Roberts 

Mission: Christine Dagdagan, Veronica Enriquez, Susan Ghirardelli, Michael Griggs, Jena Sovereign 

Pierce: Carlos Flores, Sean McDonald, Ngan Mork, Lupita Narkevicius, Darlene Richarte, Melinda 

Ung 

Southwest: Safir Larios-Ramirez, Cassaundra Walker 

Trade: Monica Castillo, Lori Hunter, Jose Rosas, Kookie Williams 

Valley: Aleta Campbell, Teresa Dunham-Frost, Phillip Highley, ChaQuanda Laughlin, Alicen Vera 

West: Maritza Medina, Tamara Washington  

Retirees: Donald Santoianni 

Guests: Mark Bergquist, Natalie Embrey 
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Executive Board Action 
Call to order at 5:33pm 

Remove the flag salute from the agenda 

III. Approval of agenda M/S/P Michael Griggs and Mitch Polin 
IV. Action Items 

a. Election Committee Recommendation 
i. Mail-in ballot for re-run of District-wide Officers elections M/S/P Michael Griggs 

and Jennifer Estrada 

Call the question Sean McDonald 
Request for Roll Call Vote Chad Baugher 
Motion for a mail-in ballot 30 Aye 11 Nay 3 Abstain 

V. Election Committee Report 
a. Timeline presented to Executive Board: will go out by email, posted on website, and 

sent via USPS; all officer positions are being elected; nominations open to all; timeline 
does not state that notice of nominations and elections are being mailed, but it is a 
typo, they will be sent out via Constant Contact, posted on website, and sent via USPS 

b. Elections Rules were presented to Executive Board; there is a nomination acceptance 
form in the rules that needs to be returned by the candidates; notice of nominations 
has information about nomination process, eligibility, and other pertinent information; 
to be mailed out and posted on the website on Wednesday, March 21st 

c. Concern about if this is a re-run of the previous election, why are the nominations being 
opened to the entire membership? It is a re-run of the entire election versus a re-run of 
just the people who were nominated and were on the ballot. That was an option that 
could legally be done, the committee chose the option to re-run the entire election. The 
Election Committee opted to open up nominations in its entirety which is in 
contradiction to the rhetoric that “let’s just have the election done and not have it 
questioned”. The 3 individuals in question are eligible to run. No one has removed 
themselves from the original ballot. All the previous candidates have already given their 
intent to run in the election. Why did the Election Committee opt to run a new election 
by opening nominations in its entirety as opposed to running the same election that 
was run before? For Luukia, the re-run of the election was not a re-run of the people 
that were on the ballot. A re-run of the election means that nominations are part of that 
election and gives everyone an opportunity to do that. This is to be a re-run of the entire 
election, not just the bad half. It is the Election Committee’s purview to decide how to 
move forward. When CFT decided to get involved in this process, Jeff Freitas spoke as 
to how the elections would move forward if the names of the candidates on the ballot 
would not change. He spoke at the Executive Board meeting and gave the options. The 
election committee did it differently. The Election Committee overrode what Jeff said. 
Mention of this decision being voted at that meeting and people remembering things 
differently, going in circles; that comment is incorrect as minutes show otherwise. 

d. AFT Convention Delegates election coming up; once Call to Convention is received, it 
will give guidelines as to how to elect delegates; those elections can be done 
electronically since Constitution & Bylaws is silent on modality 

Meeting adjourned at 6:46pm 
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Next meeting: March 21, 2024 Location LATTC 

 

Minutes submitted by  Yovanna Campos, MBA 

  Recording Secretary 



BUSH GOTTLIEB
A Law Corporation

801 North Brand Boulevard
Suite 950

Glendale, California  91203-1260
Telephone (818) 973-3200

Fax (818) 973-3201

February 16, 2024 Invoice# 108219

AFT College Staff Guild, Local 1521A Billed through January 31, 2024

3356 Barham Boulevard
Los Angeles, CA  90068
 
Attn:  Andrea Edwards, President, aedwards@aft1521a.org
 
cc:  Troy Pierce, tpierce@aft1521a.org
       Martha Figueroa, mfigueroa@cft.org
       Luukia Smith, lsmith@cft.org
VIA EMAIL

Our file # 11521 00000 ED

BILLING SUMMARY

Total fees $13,987.50

Total costs $765.30

Total charges for this bill $14,752.80

Balance forward as of bill dated January 16, 2024

Net balance forward

$7,443.54

$7,443.54

Net balance forward

Total balance now due

$7,443.54

$22,196.34

RE:  RETAINER ($750.00/month)

 

Matter 01000

FEES

01/03/2024 ED Review emails from Butler counsel 0.3 hrs.

01/03/2024 ED Review Butler attendance records 0.5 hrs.

01/17/2024 ED Review billing/costs for MSJ; email to L. Smith re same 0.7 hrs.

01/26/2024 ED Review subpoenas and objections and email to L. Smith re same;
call with District counsel re pending objections

1.2 hrs.

01/30/2024 ED Phone call re subpoena and follow up 1.0 hrs.

01/31/2024 LRT Exchange emails re response to subpoena for production of
records

0.2 hrs.

Total fees for this matter 3.90 hrs $750.00

Erica Deutsch 3.70 hrs

Luke R. Taylor 0.20 hrs
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RE:  BUTLER DLSE CLAIM Matter 29005

FEES

01/03/2024 VCW Review SDT responses from District; draft email to ED re same 0.8 hrs. $200.00

01/08/2024 ED Review outline for MSJ and discuss with VCW 1.2 hrs. $300.00

01/08/2024 VCW Research MSJ timeline; outline MSJ with proposed evidence;
phone call with ED re next steps; phone message for C. Missakian
re deposition, settlement, and MSJ; research MSJ procedural
requirements

4.5 hrs. $1,125.00

01/09/2024 VCW Draft email to ED re next steps; review other pending V. Butler
cases; phone message for C. Missakian re deposition, settlement,
and MSJ (x 2); schedule MSJ hearing

1.0 hrs. $250.00

01/09/2024 JCV Phone call to Dept. 26 and obtain hearing date for Plaintiff's MSJ;
email to VCW and ED re same

0.5 hrs. $62.50

01/09/2024 CEM Research open and active lawsuits involving V. Butler 1.5 hrs. $187.50

01/10/2024 ED Review and revise outline for Motion and supporting declaration;
review proposed stipulation of facts

1.7 hrs. $425.00

01/10/2024 DR Review previous research on LMRA preemption, forward to VCW
with recommendations

0.6 hrs. $150.00

01/10/2024 VCW Draft Notice of Motion and MSJ; Declaration of L. Smith;
research preemption standard; draft Memorandum of Points and
Authorities (facts, procedural posture, and start of argument)

6.9 hrs. $1,725.00

01/11/2024 ED Review and revise MSJ and declarations; review exhibits and
supporting documents

2.0 hrs. $500.00

01/11/2024 ARB Draft declaration of ED and RJN re Appellant DLSE testimony;
research re MSJ procedural requirements; evidence code
provisions re unavailable witnesses

5.2 hrs. $1,300.00

01/11/2024 AIK Research and draft MSJ standard 1.3 hrs. $325.00

01/11/2024 VCW Phone with C. Missakian re deposition, settlement, and MSJ;
finalize draft factual stipulations; draft email to C. Missakian re
draft factual stipulation; Declaration of VCW; and Memorandum
of Points and Authorities (facts, procedural posture, standard of
review, argument through preemption, and conclusion)

10.7 hrs. $2,675.00

01/12/2024 ED Review and revise MSJ papers; edit and review exhibits 2.2 hrs. $550.00

01/12/2024 ARB Review and revise Memorandum of Points and Authorities 0.4 hrs. $100.00

01/12/2024 VCW Finish drafting Memorandum of Points and Authorities; finalize
request for Judicial Notice and ED Declaration; review filing
requirements re audio file; review and revise Notice of Motion and
Motion for Summary Judgment, Memorandum of Points and
Authorities, L. Smith Declaration, ED Declaration, VCW
Declaration, and Request for Judicial Notice based on feedback
from ED; finalize and file documents; draft email to C. Missakian
confirming settlement off the table in light of MSJ filing; review
and respond to emails from C. Missakian re same; phone call with
ED re same; draft email to L. Smith re filed MSJ documents

7.8 hrs. $1,950.00

01/12/2024 CEM Draft Appendix of Evidence in support of Motion for Summary
Judgment; review and finalize MSJ documents; file with LA
Superior Court and serve to opposing counsel

1.5 hrs. $187.50

01/13/2024 VCW Review emails from C. Missakian re settlement; phone with ED re
same

0.2 hrs. $50.00

01/16/2024 VCW Review email from ED re additional LACCD discovery; meeting
with ED re deposition and next steps; calendar discovery deadline,
opposition brief deadline, reply brief deadline, revise notice of
deposition

0.8 hrs. $200.00

01/19/2024 VCW Meeting with ED re next steps in matter; review and revise notice 1.3 hrs. $325.00
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of deposition request to include additional document requests;
research service for notice of deposition; draft email to ED re
same; research compel discovery request timeline; draft email to
ED re same

01/22/2024 VCW Finalize notice of deposition before service on V. Butler's
attorney; email to C. Missakian re Union declining V. Butler's
settlement offer and alerting him to deposition; review response
from C. Missakian re same

0.7 hrs. $175.00

01/24/2024 VCW Review pricing for deposition transcript and video and select
vendor; draft email to ED re same

0.2 hrs. $50.00

01/31/2024 VCW Begin draft deposition outline 0.3 hrs. $75.00

Total fees for this matter 53.30 hrs $12,887.50

Adam I. Kornetsky 1.30 hrs 250.00/hr $325.00

Adrian R. Butler 5.60 hrs 250.00/hr $1,400.00

Chelsea E Mayo 3.00 hrs 125.00/hr $375.00

Dexter  Rappleye 0.60 hrs 250.00/hr $150.00

Erica Deutsch 7.10 hrs 250.00/hr $1,775.00

Judy C. Valenzuela 0.50 hrs 125.00/hr $62.50

Vanessa C. Wright 35.20 hrs 250.00/hr $8,800.00

COSTS

01/24/2024 Attorney service/courier - service of process - Express Network
(1/3/24)

$179.65

01/24/2024 Attorney service/courier - service of process - Express Network
(12/18/23)

$224.40

01/24/2024 Attorney service/courier - filing at L.A. Superior Court - Express
Network (1/12/24)

$361.25

Total costs for this matter $765.30

RE:  ELECTION CHALLENGE

 

Matter 32004

FEES

01/30/2024 ED Review election challenge decision 0.6 hrs. $150.00

01/30/2024 MEP Review AFT decision re eligibility 0.3 hrs. $75.00

01/31/2024 ED Review final decision re member standing 0.5 hrs. $125.00

Total fees for this matter 1.40 hrs $350.00

Erica Deutsch 1.10 hrs 250.00/hr $275.00

Michael E. Plank 0.30 hrs 250.00/hr $75.00



BUSH GOTTLIEB
A Law Corporation

801 North Brand Boulevard
Suite 950

Glendale, California  91203-1260
Telephone (818) 973-3200

Fax (818) 973-3201

March 18, 2024 Invoice# 108361

AFT College Staff Guild, Local 1521A Billed through February 29, 2024

3356 Barham Boulevard
Los Angeles, CA  90068
 
Attn:  Andrea Edwards, President, aedwards@aft1521a.org
 
cc:  Troy Pierce, tpierce@aft1521a.org
       Martha Figueroa, mfigueroa@cft.org
       Luukia Smith, lsmith@cft.org
VIA EMAIL

Our file # 11521 00000 ED

BILLING SUMMARY

Total fees $6,887.50

Total costs $43.40

Total charges for this bill $6,930.90

Balance forward as of bill dated February 16, 2024

Payment(s)--last payment deposited February 26, 2024

Net balance forward

$22,196.34

$22,196.34

$0.00

Total balance now due $6,930.90

RE:  RETAINER ($750.00/month)

 

Matter 01000

FEES

02/01/2024 LRT Draft certification of no records and send same to L. Smith for
signature in response to subpoena from Kathleen Margaret
Sullivan

0.7 hrs.

02/02/2024 LRT Revise response to subpoena based on new information; draft
email to L. Smith re same; submit signed certificate to
promulgating counsel and to Bosco Legal Services

1.0 hrs.

02/06/2024 LRT Evaluate email from Bosco Legal re response to Kathleen
Margaret Sullivan subpoena; draft response to Bosco Legal re
same

0.3 hrs.

Total fees for this matter 2.00 hrs $750.00

Luke R. Taylor 2.00 hrs
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RE:  BUTLER DLSE CLAIM Matter 29005

FEES

02/01/2024 VCW Draft Butler Deposition outline; compile exhibits for deposition;
draft email to ED re deposition outline; research penalties should
Butler not show to deposition; research deadline for Butler to
object to deposition or deposition production requests

4.3 hrs. $1,075.00

02/02/2024 VCW Confirm stenographer and videographer for Butler deposition 0.2 hrs. $50.00

02/05/2024 VCW Review and revise deposition outline; prepare deposition exhibits;
prepare for deposition

1.3 hrs. $325.00

02/06/2024 ED Prepare for deposition with VCW 0.5 hrs. $125.00

02/06/2024 VCW Prepare for deposition; wait for deponent; make statement on the
record at no-show deposition; review and respond to email from
C. Missakian re deposition; meeting with ED re same

1.6 hrs. $400.00

02/07/2024 ED Review and respond to email from VCW and Butler attorney re
deposition

0.2 hrs. $50.00

02/07/2024 VCW Research sanctions for failure to appear at deposition; review and
respond to email from C. Missakian re V. Butler's willingness to
attend a deposition; conference with ED re dates; draft email to C.
Missakian to convey possible deposition dates

0.8 hrs. $200.00

02/22/2024 VCW Review transcript from V. Butler no-show deposition; draft email
to ED to convey transcript

0.3 hrs. $75.00

02/23/2024 IG Draft emails to ED, VCW re Butler deposition 0.6 hrs. $150.00

02/23/2024 ED Review and respond to email from counsel re deposition of V.
Butler; confer with VCW

0.4 hrs. $100.00

02/23/2024 VCW Review email from C. Missakian re deposition date; draft email to
IG re deposition

0.7 hrs. $175.00

02/24/2024 IG Deposition preparation 0.3 hrs. $75.00

02/26/2024 VCW Review and respond to C. Missakian's email re deposition date;
review and respond to email from C. Missakian re pushing back
on in-person deposition and length; draft email to ED re same

0.6 hrs. $150.00

02/27/2024 VCW Review and respond to email from C. Missakian confirming
deposition; initiate scheduling stenographer and videographer

0.3 hrs. $75.00

02/29/2024 VCW Review and revise draft deposition outline and exhibits in
preparation for deposition on 3/13; draft email to IG and ED re
same; review and revise exhibits based on feedback

1.9 hrs. $475.00

02/29/2024 JCV Arrange court reporter and videographer for upcoming arbitration 0.5 hrs. $62.50

Total fees for this matter 14.50 hrs $3,562.50

Erica Deutsch 1.10 hrs 250.00/hr $275.00

Ira L. Gottlieb 0.90 hrs 250.00/hr $225.00

Judy C. Valenzuela 0.50 hrs 125.00/hr $62.50

Vanessa C. Wright 12.00 hrs 250.00/hr $3,000.00

COSTS

02/29/2024 Printing $43.40

Total costs for this matter $43.40

RE:  ELECTION CHALLENGE

 

Matter 32004

FEES
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02/08/2024 MEP Review and respond to email from M. Bergquist re updated
election rules and timeline

0.9 hrs. $225.00

02/08/2024 MEP Phone call with M. Bergquist re rules and timeline 0.3 hrs. $75.00

02/28/2024 MEP Review election rules and respond to email from Election
Committee

1.0 hrs. $250.00

Total fees for this matter 2.20 hrs $550.00

Michael E. Plank 2.20 hrs 250.00/hr $550.00

RE:  BUTLER AFT LITIGATION SUBPOENA

 

Matter 33005

FEES

02/05/2024 ED Review and revise deposition outline 1.5 hrs. $375.00

Total fees for this matter 1.50 hrs $375.00

Erica Deutsch 1.50 hrs 250.00/hr $375.00

RE:  JAMES HIGHLEY GRIEVANCE

 

Matter 34001

FEES

02/08/2024 ED Review and respond to email from Luukia Smith re arbitrators 0.5 hrs. $125.00

02/12/2024 ED Review and respond to email from Luukia Smith re arbitrators;
email exchange re same

0.4 hrs. $100.00

02/13/2024 SY Review grievance information and analyze likelihood of success 0.7 hrs. $175.00

02/15/2024 SY Draft memorandum re analysis of grievance 0.9 hrs. $225.00

02/20/2024 SY Review CBA and prior grievance steps; draft memorandum re
grievance recommendation

1.4 hrs. $350.00

02/21/2024 SY Draft memorandum re grievance recommendation 0.3 hrs. $75.00

02/25/2024 ED Review and revise memo re likelihood of success 0.5 hrs. $125.00

02/26/2024 SY Draft memo re grievance recommendation 1.3 hrs. $325.00

02/27/2024 ED Review and revise memo re case evaluation and send to client;
follow up email exchange

0.6 hrs. $150.00

Total fees for this matter 6.60 hrs $1,650.00

Erica Deutsch 2.00 hrs 250.00/hr $500.00

Sara  Yufa 4.60 hrs 250.00/hr $1,150.00



















Gloria Moreno, Chapter Chair 
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Gloria Moreno, Chapter Chair   LaShawn Duffin, Delegate 

Olga Hernandez, Delegate  Hazel Alonzo, Alternate Delegate  Yung Kim, Alternate Delegate 

Kimberly Davillier, Grievance Representative 
 

Chapter Report 
February 2024 

 

Chapter Executive Board 
Chapter Executive Board Team Meeting – Thursday, February 8, 2024 
Attendees: Gloria Moreno – Chapter Chair, La Shawn Duffin – Delegate, Kimberly Davillier – Grievance 
Representative 
 

Chapter Meeting 
Chapter Member Meeting – No Chapter Meeting for February 2024 

 

Consultations 
• PC Consultation Meeting – Meetings are scheduled every 6 weeks  

No meeting scheduled this month.  

• DO HR Consultation Meeting – Thursday, 02/27/2024 @ 9:30 am (In-
Person) 
No meeting – Cancelled, VC not available. Meeting rescheduled for In-Person 03/04/2024  

  

Unit Member Issues/Inquiries 
• COLA status 

• Employee feels harassed by manager. 
• Employee inquiry regarding toxic work environment on-going situation. 

 

Shared Governance/Other Committees 
• WEC – no committee meetings have been scheduled.  
• TPPC – Thursday, 02/01/2024 Attended by Anis, AFT 1521A Rep, minutes submitted. 

 

Interviews/Hiring Committees 
• HR Resource Assistant – interviews Mon. 02/05/2024, Thur. 02/08/2024 

• Software Systems Engineer – interviews Tues. 02/06/2024 
• Accounting Systems Analyst – interviews Mon. 02/12/2024 
• Sr. Procurement Specialist – interviews Tues. 02/13/2024 
• Accountant – interviews Wed. 02/21/2024 
• Sr. Accountant – interviews Wed. 02/28/2024 

 

Upcoming Interviews 
• Admin. Assistant Workforce Dev. & Adult Ed. – not moving forward with interviews 
• Administrative Intern HR – interviews scheduled for Mon. 03/11/2024, Tues. 03/12/2024 

 
 



Gloria Moreno, Chapter Chair 
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Other: 
• E-Board Planning Meeting – Thursday, 02/01/2024 

Gloria Moreno - Chapter Chair in attendance. 
• Elections Committee Meeting – Friday, 02/02/2024 

Gloria Moreno – Chapter Chair in attendance. 
• Chapter Reports – Monday 02/05/2024 

Gloria Moreno - Chapter Chair. 
• Employee Consult Meeting – Tuesday 02/06/2024 

District Employee, Gloria Moreno - Chapter Chair, La Shawn Duffin – Delegate, Kimberly 
Davillier – Grievance Rep. in attendance. 

• Elections Committee Meeting – Friday, 02/09/2024 
Gloria Moreno, Chapter Chair in attendance. 

• Hiring Committee – Tuesday 02/13/2024 
Gloria Moreno, Chapter Chair – AFT 1521A Rep. 

• Elections Committee Meeting – Thursday, 02/22/2024 
Gloria Moreno, Chapter Chair in attendance. 

• Elections Committee Meeting – Friday 02/23/2024 
Gloria Moreno, Chapter Chair in attendance. 
 
 
 
 

 
 
 
 

 
 





















 

 

March 6, 2024 
 

 Executive Board Report – 2nd Vice President February 2024 
 

Hello all,  
 

AFT1521A Standing Meetings: 
• Executive Board Meeting - February 8, 2024 Cancelled by Luukia Smith 

 

AFT1521A Membership Meetings: 
• Nothing to report 

 

Campus Site Visits 
• Nothing to report 

 

District Shared Governance Meetings 
• Consultation with Management - Tuesday February 6, 2024 

• Consultation Personnel Commission - Monday February 12, 2024 

• Institutional Effectiveness & Student Success Committee – February 21, 2024 

• Facilities Master Planning & Oversight Committee – February 21, 2024 
 

Conference/Training 
• Nothing to report 

 

Negotiations 
• Meeting with Negotiations team 

o Tuesday February 6, 2024 
o Thursday February 8, 2024 
o Thursday February 29, 2024 

 

• Meeting with Management 
o Friday February 9, 2024 

 

Other 
• Nothing to report 

 

If you have any questions or concerns please give me a call me at (323) 851-1521. 
 

Sincerely, 
 

Maira Cruz 
2nd Vice President 



 
 

March 21, 2024 

 

EXECUTIVE BOARD REPORT-Treasurer 

 

Guild Members,  

 

Since last report, have been working to compile data to assist in keeping our Guild solvent, and 

assisting Monitor in anyway possible. Answer queries regarding reimbursement and receive Guild 

bills and invoices (ie) CFT/AFT Per Capitas. Sit on various committees, both shared governance as 

well as internal committees, as indicated below.  

 

 

      Committees/Meetings 

• Steering Committee (Officers)  

• Consultation with Personnel Commission 

• Consultation with LACCD Management 

• Negotiating Team Meeting  

• Negotiating Meeting w/LACCD  

• Executive Board Planning Meeting 

• Executive Board Meeting (LASC -Cancelled) 

• Board of Trustees Legislative & Public Affairs Committee 

 

Miscellaneous 

• Compile and process, for accuracy, OPEIU timesheets for payroll 

• Attend COPE meeting with CFT representatives (2/2/2024) 

• Attend meeting with Sign Language Interpreters (2/15/2024) 

 

This is a very brief snapshot for the month of February 2024  If you would like to contact me, you 

may do so at anytime TPierce@aft1521A.org, or call (323) 851-1521.   

 

Fraternally, 

 

Troy L. Pierce, Treasurer 

AFT College Staff Guild 

Local 1521A 

 

mailto:TPierce@aft1521A.org


 
American 
Federation of 
Teachers, 
College Staff Guild 
Local 1521A, CFT, 
AFL-CIO 
 
 
Representing the 
clerical/technical 
professionals of the 
Los Angeles 
Community College 
District 
 
 
3356 Barham Blvd. 
Los Angeles, CA 
90068 
323-851-1521 
www.aft1521a.org 

 
 

Chad Baugher 
Grievance 
Secretary 
323-580-6959 
cbaugher@aft1521
a.org  
 

EXECUTIVE BOARD REPORT 
GRIEVANCE SECRETARY 

February 2024 
 
Guild Members, 
 
Since my last report, I have been working and consulting with Grievance 
Representatives, Chapter Chairs, Guild Officers as well as individual Unit 1 members to 
address complaints, issues of concern and grievances.  
 

Immediate issues at hand 
 

Member Representation 
 Consult with Grievance Representatives on issues. 
 Represented Members under Negative Evaluation 
 Trained and Educated New Grievance Reps (ELAC, LAMC, LACC) 
 Work with Chapter Chairs on pending issues. 
 Travel to campuses for in person meetings/consultations 
 Grievances: 

o LAVC – Step 2 – Financial Aid Offsite Work (LAVC) 
Committees/Meetings 

 Consultation with Management 
 Consultation with Personnel Commission 
 Executive Board Meeting 
 Executive Board Committees 

o Legislative & Public Affairs Committee 
o Institutional Effectiveness & Student Success Committee 
o Facilities Master Planning & Oversight Committee 

 Negotiations 
o Concluded Negotiations – pending rectification 
o Website has a dedicated Negotiation page with all the Newsletters and 

TA Blurbs 
Miscellaneous 

 Travel to various chapters for in person meetings. 
o LAMC Membership Meeting 
o LAVC Membership Meeting 

 In collaboration with Recording Secretary, Yovanna Campos, have been able to 
re-activate the www.aft1521a.org website. 

 
This is a very brief snapshot for the month of November 2023. If you would like to 
contact me, you may do so at anytime cbaugher@aft1521a.org or (323) 580-6959 
(office) or (213)713-6777 (cell) 
 
Fraternally 
Chad Baugher, Grievance Secretary 



During Wk 
Hours

Outside Wk 
Hours

During Wk 
Hours

Outside Wk 
Hours

During Wk 
Hours

Outside Wk 
Hours

During Wk 
Hours

Outside Wk 
Hours

During Wk 
Hours

Outside Wk 
Hours

During Wk 
Hours

Outside Wk 
Hours

Chapter meeting, meeting prep and setup 0.00 0.00
Political action, including endorsements and PAC activities 0.00 0.00
Website update and maintenance 0.00 0.00
Representation 0.00 0.00
Office hours and office activities 0.00 0.00
Trainings (Please Specify) 0.00 0.00
Other (Please Specify) 0.00 0.00

Executive board meeting 4.00 0.00 4.00
Contract negotiation 0.00 0.00
Member representation 0.00 0.00
Political action, including endorsements and PAC activities 1.00 1.00 1.00 2.00 1.00
Website update and maintenance 0.00 0.00
Officers' Meeting 0.00 0.00
District committees (Please Specify) 0.00 0.00
AFT 1521A committees (Please Specify) 0.00 0.00
Trainings (Please Specify) 0.00 0.00
Other (Please Specify) 0.00 0.00

LA County Fed delegates meeting 0.00 0.00
DHLI meeting and activities 0.00 0.00
MLK parade 0.00 0.00
Labor day parade 0.00 0.00
Political action, including endorsements and PAC activities 0.00 0.00
Postal food drive 0.00 0.00
Other (Please Specify) 0.00 0.00

CFT Executive Council 0.00 0.00
Lobby Day 0.00 0.00
Labor Fed Convention 0.00 0.00
Political action, including endorsements and PAC activities 0.00 0.00
CCE Division Council Meeting 0.00 0.00
CFT State Council 0.00 0.00
CFT Convention 0.00 0.00
CCE Conference 0.00 0.00
CFT Committee (Please Specify) 0.00 0.00
CFT Trainings: (Please Specify) 0.00 0.00
Other (Please Specify) 0.00 0.00

AFT Convention 0.00 0.00
PSRP Convention 0.00 0.00
AFL-CIO Activities (Please Specify) 0.00 0.00
AFT Trainings (Please Specify) 0.00 0.00
Other (Please Specify) 0.00 0.00

D

AFT COLLEGE STAFF GUILD, LOCAL 1521A
Activity Report February 2024

Name: Julio C. Ortiz
AFT 1521A Position: COPE Coordinator

Regular Release Time Allocation (Hours): 7

C

LA County-wide Activities

Week 1 Week 2 Week 3 Week 4 Week 5 Total

A
Chapter Activities

B

District-wide Activities

State-wide Activities

E
Nation-wide Activities

Total Hours for February 2024 1.00 1.00 0.00 4.00 0.00 5.000.00 1.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 2.00



AFT Staff Guild, Local 1521A Chapter Report 

AFT Staff Guild Executive Board 

Date:   __________________________________________ 

Campus: _________________________________________ 

Campus E-Board: 

_____________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________ 
_____________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________ 
_____________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________ 
_____________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________ 

Chapter Meeting: 
_____________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________ 
_____________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________ 
_____________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________ 
_____________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________ 

Consultation: 
_____________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________ 
_____________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________ 
_____________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________ 
_____________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________ 

Unit member issues/updates: 
_____________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________ 
_____________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________ 
_____________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________ 
_____________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________ 

Shared Governance /Other Committees: 
_____________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________ 
_____________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________ 
_____________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________ 
_____________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________ 

Classified Hiring Committee 
_____________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________ 
_____________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________ 
_____________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________ 
_____________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________ 

Classified Hiring:  
_____________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________ 
_____________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________ 
_____________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________ 
_____________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________ 

Other: 
_____________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________ 
_____________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________ 
_____________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________ 
_____________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________ 

AFT Staff Guild Officers 
President Hazel Alonzo | First Vice President: JoAnn Haywood | Second Vice President: Mario Perez 

Secretary: Yovanna Campos  | Treasurer: Kristine Ayvazyan
Grievance Secretary: Troy Pierce 



LA County Federation of Labor, AFL-CIO 
Representative to the House of Labor 
Monday, January 22, 2024 @ 7:00 p.m. 

 
 

Called to Order/Pledge of Allegiance, AND “Code of Conduct” Posted on Projector for All to Read. 

  

- President Wheeler; Special Presentation, Over 35 Years, Armando Olivias, now Retiring 1.31.24. Began career as Staff of 

  United Way. Video Presentation of Decades of Career. $50 Million Dollar Grant to Use, Now. 

 

- Sworn in (6) New Delegates; “Representative Oath of Obligation” List of New Delegates to be sworn in @ the next E-Board 

  Meeting, displayed on projector.  M/S/P.  

 

-E-Board Minutes for January, M/S/P. Delegate Minutes December, M/S/P. 

 

- Michelle, Financial Report; December 2023, ATTACHED, M/S/P.   

 

-Devin/Hugo, Political Report; March 5, Primary Election. CA 27 Mike Garcia, at it again We support Mike Whiteside.  

  *White Sheet (Walk 2.3.24, Need 200 Volunteers). See Attached Blue Sheet for Judges Endorsement Recommendations for  

    House of Labor Consideration, M/S/P.  

 

-Rob Notoff, Policy; Now, Deputy of Staff, $3.4 Billion Dollars for all income levels with “Affordable Housing”. “Abolish Poverty  

 And Homelessness”. LA Housing & Homelessness Solutions Measure replacing Measure H. Need 400,000 Signatures to get on  

 the Ballot. *Rob can come out to speak with our members. 

 

- Michelle Namako give names for Lapel Pins from MLK, Jr. Breakfast. 

 

-Tatianna Martinez, Communications; Story Submission “On the Move” encouraged. 

 

-Patricia; Organizing Report calendar, Musician, Unite 11 (Hotel Workers) Prime 9 UHW Members fired, Action. Scott,  

President/Vice President, Nurse for 28 years spoke before the Body on Medicare Fraud @ St. Francis, Demonstrated @ 

Headquarters in Ontario, CA. *CFA Flyer (Faculty/Student) spoke mentioning Staff, as well. 

 

- Steve Neal, People’s Project; Final Report, 15 Families, Over $43,000.00 with Rental Assistance. 600 Motel Vouchers up to  

  14 Days UFCW, Metro Cards, Assisted with Eviction Stoppages, and Gas Cards, distributed.  

 

-Armando (New Interim), Labor Community Services; 2023 Year Highlights.*Presentations, Maui Relief Efforts, Hollywood     

 Labor Strike Assistance. “When The Paycheck Stops” course upcoming.  

 

-Armando, Miguel Contreras Foundation; Foundation Fundraiser, Friday, May 3, 2024 and Cinco de Mayo Awards. 

 

-President Wheeler’s Report; Spoke on Measure H, MLK, Jr. Breakfast, Phenomenal Event. Street Name for Rev. Lawson. 

 

Affiliates Report/See Attached Flyers 

 

District 19, Railroad Safety Act, Demonstration. Airport, Airline Workers @ LAX Demonstration, and Figueroa Hotel 

Demonstration where Pellets were shot @ demonstrators, No Police Help for (3) Three Hours after folks went into 

the Building for Safety while Demonstrating (Call Hotel/Police to support employees efforts). 

 

 
Respectfully Submitted, 

Dionne M. Morrissette, AFT1521A  

LA County Fed. Of Labor, AFL-CIO  

Representative to the House of Labor, Delegate  































































LA County Federation of Labor, AFL-CIO 
Representative to the House of Labor 
Monday, February 26, 2024 @ 7:00 p.m. 

 
Called to Order/Pledge of Allegiance, AND “Code of Conduct” Posted on Projector for All to Read. 

  

- Sworn in New Delegates; “Representative Oath of Obligation” List of New Delegates to be sworn in @ the next E-Board 

  Meeting, displayed on projector.  M/S/P.  

 

 

-E-Board Minutes for February, M/S/P. Delegate Minutes January, M/S/P. 

 

 

- Michelle, Financial Report; January 2024, ATTACHED, M/S/P.   

 

 

-Devin/Hugo, Political Report;  

 See Attached Blue Sheet, Endorsement Recommendations for House of Labor Consideration, M/S/P.  

 

 

-Tatianna Martinez, Communications; “On the Move” is out, comes out every Wednesday. Any stories are welcome for  

  Showcasing. Trainings coming for those who are interested for their Local. *Video shown for MLK, Jr. Breakfast, Parade,  

  “Happy Black History Month”. Note: Reach out to Communication Team for “Video Clips” of MLK, Jr. Events/Activities. 

 

 

-Rosie; See “The Crew”, Flyer (Yellow/Black) and “Food 4 Less”, Flyer; Support Needed for Both. 

 

 

-Rob Notoff, Policy; Homelessness/Poverty, Signatures needed, 3 Billion for Homes, Built by Labor. 1.3 Eviction Defense,  

  263,000 Signatures with 220,000 Already Signed, and 2-1/2 more months to get the Signatures. March 16th, Big Day, Long  

  Beach or LA County Fed. 

 

 

-Steve Neal, Organizing; Encouraged, and stressed the urgency for March 16th, and obtaining signatures for Ballot.  

 

 

-Armando, Labor Community Services; Video PowerPoint DOL Targeting bad acting employers of Young Meat Cutter Workers, 

  Food distributions (Walk-Through) and Mission Hills (Drive-Through). REMINDER “Letter Carriers Food Drive” SAVE THE DATE.  

  Unions can adopt a Facility! For Rent, Mortgage, Utility Assistance; Send Folks to Them. 

 

 

-Armando, Miguel Contreras Foundation; 2023 High Road Career Programs Update. New Board President, Michael Contreras  

  (Thom Davis, stepped down). Per Thom Davis, Two (2) Seats Open; Will vote on next meeting. 

 

 

-President Wheeler’s Report; Labor Roundtable held earlier this month, LA Fed. with Lorena Gonzalez, and 50 Participants. 

 

Affiliates Report 

*Refer to attached flyers 

 

Respectfully Submitted, 

Dionne M. Morrissette, AFT1521A  

LA County Fed. Of Labor, AFL-CIO  

Representative to the House of Labor, Delegate  



Washington, DC | Chicago, IL | New York, NY | Los Angeles, CA
calibrecpa.com

811 WILSHIRE BOULEVARD | SUITE 1450
LOS ANGELES, CA 90017 

212.341.4684 PHONE  

To the Executive Board of the  
   American Federation of Teachers College Staff Guild, Local 1521A 

We are engaged to audit the consolidated financial statements of the American 
Federation of Teachers College Staff Guild, Local 1521A (the Local) for the years ended 
June 30, 2022, and 2023. Professional standards require that we provide you with the 
following information related to our audit. 

Our Responsibility under U.S. Generally Accepted Auditing Standards 

As stated in our engagement letter dated February 8, 2024, our responsibility, as 
described by professional standards, is to express an opinion about whether the 
consolidated financial statements prepared by management with your oversight are 
fairly presented, in all material respects, in conformity with U.S. generally accepted 
accounting principles. Our audit of the consolidated financial statements does not 
relieve you or management of your responsibilities. 

Planned Scope, Timing of the Audit, Significant Risks, and Other 

An audit includes examining, on a test basis, evidence supporting the amounts and 
disclosures in the consolidated financial statements; therefore, our audit will involve 
judgement about the number of transactions to be examined and the areas to be 
tested. 

Our audit will include obtaining an understanding of the Local and its environment, 
including internal control, sufficient to assess the risks of material misstatement of the 
consolidated financial statements and to design the nature, timing, and extent of further 
audit procedures. Material misstatements may result from (1) errors, (2) fraudulent 
financial reporting, (3) misappropriation of assets, or (4) violations of laws or governmental 
regulations that are attributable to the Local or to acts by management or employees 
acting on behalf of the Local. We will generally communicate our significant findings at 
the conclusion of the audit. However, some matters could be communicated sooner, 
particularly if significant difficulties are encountered during the audit where assistance is 
needed to overcome the difficulties or if the difficulties may lead to a modified opinion. 
We will also communicate any internal control related matters that are required to be 
communicated under professional standards. 



We have identified the following significant risks of material misstatement as part of our 
audit planning: 

Improper revenue recognition of dues

Management override of internal controls

Intended Use of This Letter

This information is intended solely for the use of the Executive Board and management 
of the Local and is not intended to be and should not be used by anyone other than 
these specified parties. 

Bethesda, MD 
February 8, 2024 
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